
William Paley’s Teleological Argument (1809) 

IN crossing a heath, suppose I pitched my foot against a stone, and were 
asked how the stone came to be there; I might possibly answer, that, for 

any thing I knew to the contrary, it had lain there for ever: nor would it 
perhaps be very easy to show the absurdity of this answer. But suppose I 

had found a watch upon the ground, and it should be inquired how the 
watch happened to be in that place; I should hardly think of the answer 

which I had before given, that, for any thing I knew, the watch might 
have always been there. Yet why should not this answer serve for the 

watch as well as for the stone? why is it not as admissible in the second 
case, as in the first? For this reason, and for no other, viz. that, when we 

come to inspect the watch, we perceive (what we could not discover in the 
stone) that its several parts are framed and put together for a purpose, e. 

g. that they are so formed and adjusted as to produce motion, and that 

motion so regulated as to point out the hour of the day; that, if the 
different parts had been differently shaped from what they are, of a 

different size from what they are, or placed after any other manner, or in 
any other order, than that in which they are placed, either no motion at all 

would have been carried on in the machine, or none which would have 
answered the use that is now served by it. To reckon up a few of the 

plainest of these parts, and of their offices, all tending to one result:-- We 
see a cylindrical box containing a coiled elastic spring, which, by its 

endeavour to relax itself, turns round the box. We next observe a flexible 
chain (artificially wrought for the sake of flexure), communicating the 

action of the spring from the box to the fusee. We then find a series of 
wheels, the teeth of which catch in, and apply to, each other, conducting 

the motion from the fusee to the balance,and from the balance to the 
pointer; and at the same time, by the size and shape of those wheels, so 

regulating that motion, as to terminate in causing an index, by an equable 

and measured progression, to pass over a given space in a given time. We 
take notice that the wheels are made of brass in order to keep them from 

rust; the springs of steel, no other metal being so elastic; that over the 
face of the watch there is placed a glass, a material employed in no other 

part of the work, but in the room of which, if there had been any other 
than a transparent substance, the hour could not be seen without opening 

the case. This mechanism being observed (it requires indeed an 
examination of the instrument, and perhaps some previous knowledge of 

the subject, to perceive and understand it; but being once, as we have 
said, observed and understood), the inference, we think, is inevitable, that 

the watch must have had a maker: that there must have existed, at some 
time, and at some place or other, an artificer or artificers who formed it 

for the purpose which we find it actually to answer; who comprehended its 
construction, and designed its use.  

 

 



Problems with the Teleological Argument 

 

 How strong is the Paley’s analogy between the 

watch and the earth?  The earth is organic 

whereas the watch is mechanical. 

 

 Why should there be only one designer? There 

could be many designers/gods/powerful beings 

 

 The “design faults” that exist in the earth (e.g. 

earthquakes) suggest that the designer is not 

very powerful. This is not generally what 

theists want to believe.   

 

 The existence of evil in the Universe suggests 

that the designer is not good. This is not 

generally what theists want to believe. 

 

 Who designed the designer? 

 

 Evolution as alternative explanation. The 

complexity that we experience did not occur 

“by chance” and neither was it created.  

Evolution can explain why some things appear 

to have been designed.   
 

 

 


